Bid Tabulation

Middle School Social Studies Curriculum Materials

Gibbs Houghton Savvas Discovery
TCI Smith Mifflin Learning Education
Education Harcourt Company Inc.
Bid Bond N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Familial Disclosure Yes Yes N/A No Yes
Iran Sanctions Affidavit Yes Yes N/A No Yes
6" Grade:
We are looking for a sixth grade Social Studies
resource aligned to Michigan standards and
infused with inquiry, emphasizing hands-on
learning and critical thinking.
Quantity |Description .
14 Teache.r.Edltl.on/Resource Package - 6 GRATIS* GRATIS i
Year Digital license
456 Student Edition textbook (print)* aligned $41,952 $50,374.32 N/A
to Ml standards Includes 6-yr Digital Includes 6-yr digital
. . $42,658 NO PROPOSAL $49,012.38 $60,600
Student Edition textbook- 6 Year Digital NO BID
1010 |ic2ni2 tion textbook- Year Digita 554 Additional 6-yr SUBMITTED 554 Additional 6-yr | $10 per student, per
digital totals 1010 digital totals 1010 year
L , $2,097.60 $4,070.30**
Shi & Handli d/orP
Feepplng andling and/or Processing 5% on non digital 7.6% on non digital -
products products
COST OF IMPLEMENTATION- 6th grade $86,707.60 INCOMPLETE NO BID $103,457.00 INCOMPLETE

* GRATIS offer is valid for this quote only and contingent upon purchase order total matching or exceeding the quote total.
** Shipping costs are negotiable.




7" Grade:

We are looking for a seventh grade Social

Gibbs

Houghton Savvas Discovery
Studies resource aligned to Michigan standards TCl Smith Mifflin Learning Education
and infused with inquiry, emphasizing hands-on Education Harcourt Company Inc.
learning and critical thinking.
Quantity |Description
Teacher Edition/Resource Package - 6 $1,258.60
1 GRATIS* -
4 Year Digrital license Includes 5-yr digital GRATIS
$97,888
Two text includ
Student Edition textbook (print)* aligned exts are Inciu .ed $26,573.4 $56,110.04
532 to Ml standards to complete the Includes 1-yr digital Includes 6-yr digital N/A
alignment to Ml 7th yraig yrdig
Grade standards
$7,974.68 for 532 NO BID
. . . additional 1-yr digital, $44,938.04 $63,840
St t Edition textbook- 6 Year Digital included with Text
1064 Iic:(rj\:z on carie surchase X plus $53,146.80 532 Additional 6-yr | $10 per student, per
P Additional 5 years digital totals 1064 year
digital for 1064
. . $4894.40 $4,505.80**
ippi Handl d/or P
izlepplng & Handling and/or Processing 5% on non digital $2,226.56 7.6% on non digital -
products products
COST OF IMPLEMENTATION-7th grade $102,782.40 $89.921.44 NO BID $105,553.90 INCOMPLETE
* GRATIS offer is valid for this quote only and contingent upon purchase order total matching or exceeding the quote total.
** Shipping costs are negotiable.
TOTAL COST OF IMPLEMENTATION $189,490.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE $209,010.89 INCOMPLETE




